
Part Number: KTM-1190-A(E)

Description: Canyon Dual Sport Saddle

Fitment: 2014-2019 KTM 1190 & 1290 Adventure, Adventure R, Super Adventure

Revision: 2
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Saddle mounts to your KTM just like stock with 
brackets preinstalled on the Corbin seats. 

1.  Remove stock seat.

2.  To install the Corbin saddle, simply slide the
saddle into place nose first to engage the tongues
and lower the rear into place. Push firmly on the 
passenger platform to latch.  (Figure 1)

HEATER INSTALLATION:

With Factory Wiring

1.  Install your heated seat by first plugging the
connectors on the Corbin seat to the connectors
on the bike (Figure 2 & 3), then test the switch for
proper function. 

2.  Proceed with saddle mounting as outlined
above.

3.  To release use the stock key.

Without Factory Wiring

1. Included with your electric heated seat you will
find a short wiring pigtail with built in fuse 
(Figure 4).

2.  Connect the red wire with built in fuse to the
stock black with red stripe connector under the
tail section (Figure 5).

3.  Using a 10mm socket wrench, disconnect the
battery negative terminal, then attach the negative
wire to the battery (Figure 6). 

Tools Required Parts List
10mm Socket Wrench 1  KTM Wiring Harness

1  Zip Tie

FRONT PLUG

REAR PLUG



4.  Route the pigtail to assure no wires will be
pinched and secure with zip ties... just secure it in
place for cleanliness (Figure 7). 

5. You are now ready to install your saddle.
Simply plug the wiring harness into the seat and
test. To do this, turn on your ignition switch and
flip the switch on the saddle. If the switch 
illuminates, the saddle heater is working. 

6. Install the saddle as outlined above.

NOTE: The heater is controlled by the switch
along the side of the saddle.  The temperature is
regulated by an internal thermostat when the
heater switch is turned on. 

Enjoy your new saddle!

Questions? Give us a holler...

800-223-4332
tech@corbin.com
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